

BALANCED APPROACH FOR TENDERING PRACTICE AT THE PRE-CONTRACT STAGE: THE UK PRACTITIONER'S PERSPECTIVE

Seoung-Wook WHANG^{1*}, Sohrab DONYAVI¹, Roger FLANAGAN², Sangyong KIM³

¹School of Architecture Computing and Engineering, University of East London, London, UK ²School of Construction Management and Engineering, University of Reading, Reading, UK ³School of Architecture, Yeungnam University, 280 Daehak-ro, Gyeongsan-si 712-749, Gyeongsangbuk-do, Republic of Korea

Received 24 August 2021; accepted 2 January 2022

Abstract. Tender documents often lack clarity and are incomplete, making it difficult for contractors to appropriately price projects. A general view is that the quality of tender documents has declined, which has affected the bidding strategies of contractors. However, the academic literature has focused mainly upon the views of contractors. To obtain a more balanced view of tendering practices, in-depth interviews were conducted with 10 practitioners (client, consultant, and contractor) who are involved in a common project at the same time in the UK construction industry. The contractor was satisfied that the quality of tender documents had been consistent. By contrast, both the client and the consultant agreed that the quality of tender documents is an ongoing issue. During the study it was revealed that tendering practice is influenced by the relationship between stakeholders or the unbalanced access to information rather than the accuracy and analysis of tender documentations. Tendering practices and proposed efficient ways of improving the bidding environment were examined. Using the awareness of other project stakeholder's perspectives, this study can help the contractor to establish suitable tendering practices, and to mitigate tender risk at the bidding stage, which could effectively be implemented in the UK construction industry.

Keywords: risk management, tender document, tendering practice, bidding.

Introduction

The tendering stage for proposal construction projects is an important phase for all project stakeholders., The client will assess many criteria throughout the tendering process in order to select the best tender offer. Clients consider various factors in the selection process other than lowest price, such as the contractor's ability to hand over a project on time and to manage the risk (Puri & Tiwari, 2014; Cheaitou et al., 2019; Reza Alavipour & Arditi, 2018). Contractors win projects on many criteria, other than just offering the lowest price. Having a well-developed design with reliable tender information is important for all the stakeholders involved in the bid process. However, the initial information provided by the client may not always be sufficiently well developed for the contractor to confidently price a project. Every project involves uncertainty and risk; the tender documents must be transparent and

be explicit about the project. The poor quality of tender documents has been identified as one of the critical factors affecting the bidding strategy of contractors during the tender stage, from bid/no-bid decisions through to markup apportionment (Laryea & Lubbock, 2013; Liu et al., 2016; Hastie et al., 2017; Urquhart et al., 2017). Poor quality tender documents can lead to additional administrative processes, such as tender queries, qualified tender offers, and unreliable pricing. Poor tender documents are likely to hinder the reliability of the overall bidding process (Arabiat et al., 2007; Laryea & Hughes, 2011).

Research on the quality of tender documents is based on studies that have only considered the contractors' perspective. It would be informative to investigate how document producers, such as clients, and design team consultants perceive this issue of the quality of tender informa-

*Corresponding author. E-mail: s.w.whang@uel.ac.uk

Copyright © 2022 The Author(s). Published by Vilnius Gediminas Technical University

This is an Open Access article distributed under the terms of the Creative Commons Attribution License (http://creativecommons.org/licenses/by/4.0/), which permits unrestricted use, distribution, and reproduction in any medium, provided the original author and source are credited. tion. Research on the perspectives of professional quantity surveyors on factors that affect construction costs at the tender stage showed that the overall project cost will be affected by the design information produced by consultants (Adafin et al., 2016). A balanced view is needed by gathering opinions from both the client and design team stakeholders, and the production stakeholders comprising the contractor and supply chain (Tarhini et al., 2015; Saaidin et al., 2017).

Contractors argue that the poor quality of tender documents hinders them from accurately pricing a project. Tenders must state the basis of their evaluation on price, and technical issues with the weighting being used. Lack of detailed information leads to contractors adding risk contingencies into the pricing to cover for the uncertainty. A balanced view that will help all participants in the tendering process is unlikely to be obtained unless all stakeholders are included (Heravi et al., 2015). The purpose of this study is to investigate views on current tendering practice, to demonstrate the lack of a balanced view, and propose a more efficient bidding environment in the construction industry.

1. Literature review

1.1. Tendering practice

The construction sector is price-oriented (Chan et al., 2011; Zhang et al., 2018). Clients assess a wide range of criteria to select the optimal offer. Watt et al. (2010) noted that the conventional lowest-price-wins practice has been weakened by the adoption of multiple selection criteria against which clients evaluate broader aspects of the tender, such as the management skills of the contractor, safety record, environmental performance; this is sometimes referred to as the most economically advantageous tender (MEAT). However, many clients are still focused on lowest price, in a survey more than half of clients consider price to be more important than other tender evaluation criteria. According to the Cheaitou et al. (2019), even in the public sector where there are strict rules on the evaluation of tenders more than half of the projects are awarded using the principle of accepting the lowest price. The research found that assessing tenders based on the lowest price is one of the foremost causes of project delivery problems. EU procurement rules stipulate that just focusing on cost considerations may lead to quality, performance, and social issues. The selection of the most appropriate contractor should be based upon a set of criteria including, but not limited to the cost reflecting different project stakeholder's perspectives (Yuan et al., 2010; Simon et al., 2020).

Tan et al. (2010) studied the price-oriented nature of bidding by surveying 42 Hong Kong contractors. The study revealed that, although high-tech and management innovation are recognized as important criteria in the tendering strategies of contractors, the low-price principle is still prevalent in Hong Kong; a "low bid" is ranked as the primary consideration by contractors. With the complex procurement and technology issues, the trend in contractor selection has been shifted to where the influence of the low-price principle is diminishing in favour of a balanced approach. O. Alptekin and N. Alptekin's (2017) analysis, showed the lowest price as the 5th criterion among 12 criteria in the middle east and Turkey projects. Their research showed multiple decision criteria should be utilized to evaluate the contractor's attributes; the weighting of the attributes reflects the client's priorities. These criteria can be summarized as tender price, time performance, financial strength, technical competence, environmental performance, quality assurance and control, and health and safety performance, thus reflecting the project stakeholder's perspectives (Bochenek, 2014; Krishna Rao et al., 2018; Xia et al., 2018).

The competitive nature of the market means that any risk contingency allowances incorporated into the unit pricing must be balanced by how competitors may view the same uncertainty. Some contractors may price low to win the tender, in the hope that costs can be recouped through contractual claims (Alavipour & Arditi, 2018). Ahmed et al. (2016) argued that poor estimation of the project, with the cost at the tender stage results in significant consequences for the contractor, with the likelihood that the contractor will face cost overruns throughout the project.

A factor that the literature does not fully embrace is the importance of supply chain pricing. The contractor uses prices supplied by specialty contractors, manufacturers, and suppliers to build the tender price. Supply chains can be long and interdependent. If the contractor relies upon unrealistic pricing from enterprises in the supply chain, that can cause financial difficulties. The supply chain will use the tender information to base their prices, poor or inadequate information can lead to higher prices.

1.2. Risk in tendering process

Bagies and Fortune (2006) undertook research for developing a bid/no-bid decision model, they felt that because tendering is an expensive and highly complex process, the bid/no-bid decision-making stage is very important. Based on experience from previous projects, contractors are aware that inappropriate bidding practice may result in cash flow problems and ultimately financial failure of the project (Urquhart & Whyte, 2018). Laryea and Hughes (2008) revealed that various risk factors are considered: payment conditions, complexity of design and site production, ground conditions, weather, and project location. All contractors who participated in this study agreed that clients attempt to transfer the majority of the risk to the contractors. They also stated that the priced risk is likely to affect the likelihood of winning a bid, even if the director at the firm adjusts the risk margins at the final stage of the bidding process (Asgari et al., 2016; Alavipour & Arditi, 2018). In addition, the risk is highly likely to be transferred onward in the supply chain to other entities

such as subcontractors and suppliers. In a follow-up study, Laryea and Hughes (2011) investigated how contractors manage the price risks from the bidding stage. They found that the risk margin is often reduced by managerial staff at the construction firm at the pre-submission stage in the bidding process to increase the likelihood of winning the tender (Mbachu & Cross, 2015; Ahmed et al., 2016; Love et al., 2019), suggest that contractors are often reluctant to increase the risk contingency margin because it influences the likelihood of winning a tender. The ability of the contractors to manage risk from the early tender stage, such as through an exhaustive detection of tender documents, is crucial for contractors to secure projects (Yuni et al., 2017).

1.3. Quality of tender documents

Contractors rely on their analysis, intuition, and experience when they determine the final tender offer (Low et al., 2015). For contractors to produce a realistic and competitive offer, the quality of information provided by the tender documents is considered critical. Jarkas (2013) studied the factors that influence the profit margin decisions of contractors by investigating 40 identified factors which can influence profit mark-up size among Kuwait general contractors bidding on construction projects. It was found that the completeness of tender documents is a critical factor that affects the markup decision from the perspective of the local construction environment, which is driven by the lowest cost mentality. A similar study conducted by Laryea and Hughes (2011) revealed that tender documents lacked clarity. They insisted that the contractor tends to request an extension to the tender period because of incomplete tender documents and makes changes in the later tender stage, which are highly likely to impact the overall project sequence and its efficiency. Contractors stated that almost 20% of activities undertaken during the tender period were related to analyzing tender documents. They had to analyze more than 1,000 pages of tender documents within a short period of time. As a result, there were unexpected changes to those documents in the later stages. The incompleteness of information in the documents was the main factor leading to a longer tender process than originally planned.

Elhag et al. (2005) investigated the factors that affect construction costs at the pre-contract stage by interviewing UK quantity surveyors. To overcome these problems, the selection of the most appropriate contractor should be carried out and based on a set of criteria including, but not limited to, cost. They found that the completeness and quality of the project information is ranked as the main factor influencing construction costs. This study showed that quantity surveyors share the same views as contractors with regard to the quality of tender documents. However, it lacks information on the extent to which the poor quality of tender documents affects estimating of construction costs, which are likely to differ from the actual construction cost prepared by estimators and commercial managers in construction firms. It would be meaningful to gather information from different stakeholders in construction projects, such as clients, consultants, and contractors (Love et al., 2017; Hassim et al., 2018).

A study on the quality of tender documents in construction projects conducted by Laryea (2011), involved shadowing a project team at the bid stage for more than six weeks. The contractors in this study noted that there was considerable information to review and price in a short timeframe. They argued that the inadequate quality of tender documents made it even more challenging for them to price projects appropriately. In the same vein, various studies (Laryea, 2011; Urquhart et al., 2017; Cheaitou et al., 2019; Bohari et al., 2021) have stated that major issues associated with tender documents are normally inappropriate or inadequate information. Zhou et al. (2021) revealed different causes leading poor quality of tender documents including missing information, insufficient detail, impracticable design details, large blocks of provisional information that lacked detail. A significant number of tender queries (requests for information) were raised owing to the lack of clarity and missing information in the tender documents. Although previous studies have addressed the poor quality of tender documents, a balanced view of the opinions of the main project team, that is, the client, the consultant, and the contractor, is lacking.

A caveat should be added because the design team consultants are paid a fee for their professional services. The development of the design and engineering is an iterative process. If the fee for professional services is based upon a fixed price which is very low, this must ultimately impact the quality of the information that can be produced at the tender stage. It is a false economy from the client's perspective to reduce professional fees in the belief that it is a cost saving for a project. Poor quality tender information will lead to an increase in the tender price because of the need to add a contingency allowance for the unknowns.

2. Data collection and data analysis approach

This study analyzed the integrated views among the client, consultant, and contractor on the quality of tender documents. Considering the purpose of this study, this study focused on specific project stakeholders who can influence on the biding practice in the early project stage. To achieve a purposeful research result, a qualitative research method was considered, which aims to obtain through a sophisticated understanding of all dimensions of the subject matter (Chairul et al., 2019). Because the purpose of this study is to identify and analyze the stakeholder's perspectives of the bidding practice, a detailed and in-depth interview is considered more important rather than large numbers of general samples. According to Queirós et al. (2017) and Asenahabi et al. (2019), the selection of research method depends on the research scope and objective. A combina-

tion approach of literature reviews and semi-structured interviews can provide different benefits including flexibility, the possibility to specify, and motivation to participate in more depth. In qualitative research, an interview is a one of the most suitable options by offering the practical opportunity to obtain descriptive research data from the professional's knowledge, expertise, and experiences in specific areas. A mixture of open-ended and closed questions, which is one of the interview structures can not only probe into the topic, but can also encourage the interviewees to delineate and elucidate regarding the topic, which can result in an unexpected answer for the researcher (Oltmann, 2016).

This study was carried out by interviews with the different perspectives on the tendering practice and the quality of the tendering document. In order to hear the in-depth insight and practical experiences from the interviewees, a themed interview approach was used, by which there was no need to set up a strict frame for interviews to continue the flexible conversation and analyze with inductive content analysis. For interview, three parties and three or four professionals from each category (client, consultant, and contractor) would have been selected as a sample. Only the firms who carried out a common project were considered among CIOB (The Chartered Institute of Building) membership companies. A total of 27 companies who participated for 9 common projects with each other were offered an interview; three companies who were involved in one common project voluntarily participated in the interview. Thus, they would be likely to give a more balanced view of the bidding practice and quality of tender documents. In addition, it is advantageous to hear their opposite perspectives on a common project. From the three companies, the 10 practitioners included: one general manager and two principal managers at a client organization (hereafter referred to as the client); two senior project managers and one commercial manager at a contractor firm (hereafter referred to as the contractor); and four quantity surveyors at a consultancy firm (hereafter referred to as the consultant), as shown in Table 1. The 10 sample cases can be considered as representatives of the stakeholders in the construction industry, reflecting their experiences, and comprehensive analysis was obtained from their projects.

It is difficult to obtain approval for participant observation during the tender process and to analyze the actual tender documents of specific projects because of confidentiality considerations (Laryea & Hughes, 2011). The interviews were planned to obtain their views on the quality of tender documents according to their project role. The interview questions covered both overall tendering practice and specific issues faced during the tender stage on the common project they carried out: the timeframe set by the client, the bidding environment, perceptions of tender documents, contractor's tender queries and client's clarifications, contractors' bid/no-bid decision, perception of e-tendering, and suggestions for a better tendering environment. The questions were divided into four parts: preliminary, general, design stage, and tender stage questions.

Interviews were semi-structured using the mixture of open-ended and closed questions, the list of questions, together with the information sheet, was distributed prior to the interview date. For the interviews with the client and consultant, the focus was on the design and tender stage, whereas the contractor was mainly asked questions regarding bidding practices. Interviews were conducted on a one-to-one basis at the interviewees' company premises. Each interview lasted between 1.5 and 2 hours. Transcripts were produced after the interviews using audio recordings for further analysis.

	Client	Consultant	Contractor
Business sector	Historic conservation	Financial/Tax advisory, Asset management, Real estates, Construction cost consultancy	Fit-out, Construction, Engineering
Annual turnover (UK)	£15–20 Million	£4.5–5 Million (Profit for cost consultancy only)	£1.2 Billion
Staff (UK)	800 (20 in construction division)	14,000 (35 staff in cost consultancy)	2,000 (Globally)
Project type	Conservation (£300,000 worth in average)	Commercial, Residential, Mixed use, Fit-out, Conservation	Fit-out (£8–20 Million worth in average), New build
Main client	Internal	Property developer, Housing association, Local council	Corporates, University
Contract type	Joint Contracts Tribunal (JCT): Constructing Excellence, Measured term, Intermediate, Minor works	Joint Contracts Tribunal (JCT): Construction Management, Design and Build	Joint Contracts Tribunal (JCT): Design and Build
Interviewee (Years of experience)	General manager (15), Principal manager (21)	Senior quantity surveyor (12), Junior quantity surveyor (5)	Senior project manager (13), Senior commercial manager (15)

Table 1. Characterization of the interviewee

3. Findings

3.1. Tender practice

Although they were involved in a common project, their organization's overview and business characteristics were as different as their respective roles in that project as seen in Table 2. Interviews were carried out with a wide range of contents regarding the tendering practice and documents. However, their interview answers are generally on the same line with the features of their organization and their roles mainly as a client, consultant, and contractor.

Interview with the contractor. Interviews with senior project managers at one of the UK contractor firms covered current tendering practices in construction projects. With regard to the tender period, the contractor claimed that it can last more than eight weeks if the project value is sufficiently large. The contractor insisted that the number of tenderers for a project makes a difference to their bidding strategy, which affects their probability of winning the tender (De Schepper et al., 2015; Oyeyipo et al., 2016). The contractor would not participate in bidding if there were more than five competitors. Although clients generally do not notify the contractor of the number of tenderers, contractors can obtain this information from their supply chain. In addition, there are always tender queries on every project to clarify any ambiguities in tender documents. Such tender queries can also be used to build a relationship with the client team in the early stage of the project. The contractor explained this in more detail as follows:

...So tactically, it is a good decision to go back and ask questions, and also, generally, there are things you need to know as well. You will ask some genuine questions, but you also ask a lot of fishing questions, so you are fishing for more information that will help you develop your tender... A contractor who receives a tender invitation for a project that he/she cannot bid for finds it difficult to decline the bid opportunity outright. They give several excuses when declining an invitation to tender: current workload, geographical location, timescale, and type of work. The interviewee recounted how he had received a tender invitation with a short tender period of only two weeks, which was insufficient time to review and analyze the information provided by the client. It was understood that tender submission is normally at the last minute, just before the deadline. This was explained as "human nature" by the contractor:

...It's just human nature when it comes to a deadline, isn't it? If you are finishing off some other elements of a tender. Again, that's people simply juggling their workload to suit the deadline. It's the way to manage your workload, isn't it? You have to do it. It is not deliberately postponed. You are managing what you've got in front of you.

Therefore, it is apparent that contractors are unlikely to commit to the entire tender period. They tend to have several ongoing bids at the same time and plan their workload in accordance with each tender's submission date (Laryea, 2011; Wibowo et al., 2015). Complicated administrative procedures, for instance, excessive information requirements in the pre-qualification questionnaire process, can make contractors less interested in a project and may eventually affect the quality of the bid.

Interview with the consultant. The perspectives of the consultant were slightly different from those of the contractor. According to the consultant, the tender period is not only dependent on the project value, but also on the procurement route. A project under a design and build contract takes more time to analyze than a standard building contract with a firm bill of quantities (Al-Reshaid &

	Client	Consultant	Contractor
Tender period	Between 4 and 6 weeks	Between 4 and 6 weeks depending on procurement routes	About 6 to 8 weeks depending on the project value
Number of tenderers	6 for sizable projects; normally 4 or 5	3 or 4 for Design and Build contracts; 5 or 6 for standard building contracts	Generally unknown but can be found out via supply chain
Response time for tender participation from tender invitees	Normally within a week	On the first day of tender documents sent-out	Within a week
Tender queries	Queries arise in every tender	Depends on the quality of tender documents; low quality tender documents result in a high number of queries	Queries on every project
Time taken for responding to tender queries	Within two days or a week depending on the amount of queries	Within a week; takes a long time to get responses/clarifications from other consultants	A good client team gets back quickly
Extension of time for tender submission	One in three tenderers asks for an extension	Around 75% of the time there is a request for an extension to the tender period	Sometimes
Tender arrivals	Arrive at the last minute	On the last day of submission; sometimes late	Generally submitted at the last minute

Table 2. Tender practice compares

Kartam, 2005). The consultant would reveal the number of tenderers to contractors if there were only three, as it would motivate the contractors to prepare quality bids. If there are five or six tenderers, by contrast, the consultant would not reveal the number of competitors to keep the tenderers motivated. However, regardless of the procurement route or the number of competitors, contractors normally request an extension in about two-thirds of the cases, and the consultant did not agree that it was due to the short tender timeframes.

...I think contractors tend not to look at contracts until the last week. We had an occasion just the week before; we were tendering online on E-tendering and the contractor requested an extension to tender on the very first day of the tender being received, before they had even opened the tender because we could see online that they hadn't opened the tender. How can a contractor know that they need an extension before opening the tender? It must be down to a lack of resources.

They know that they don't have time. So I think if they are not going to be able to tender properly, to provide a good tender, they shouldn't accept the tender invitation in the first place. So, there's probably a disconnect between bid managers and estimators that needs to be addressed...

Sometimes contractors accept tender invitations without carefully considering their current workload and resource availability. More importantly, contractors who ask for an extension to the tender period, even before opening tender documents, may negatively affect their relationships with the consultant and client even before preparing a contract. In addition, it can lead to unnecessary tender queries that are related to the quality of tender documents. The consultants do not want any queries because it shows that the tender documents are of poor quality. However, they admitted that some queries are welcome, as it proves that contractors are committed to the project.

...But then again you kind of accept that there should be some queries because you want to know if contractors are looking into it. If you don't get any queries back at all, it might show that they are not even looking at it properly. So you probably want a couple, a few just to show they are looking at it.

Interview with the client. The client explained that there were an average of six tenderers and a four- to sixweek tender period for sizable jobs. This approach is designed to add adequate levels of competition to the tender process and is part of the organization's strategy. Regarding the bid or no-bid decisions of contractors, the client revealed that contractors are fairly prompt in notifying the client of their decision. The client claimed that contractors who declined the tender invitation were not penalized, it is important to know whether they have enough time and resources for the job. This view is not shared by the contractor. Like the consultant, the client admitted that there have been instances in which tenderers requested an extension, with price documents often arriving at the last minute. The client acknowledged that tenderers may not use the entire assigned tender period because of their on-going tender priorities.

...Because they are probably pricing several jobs all the time trying to win work. Thus, if they are going to win one job out of every six, they've got to be pricing stuff all the time. Therefore, there will be other priorities within their office and they are not just going to start it straight away, and therefore, request an extension for tendering because they are a bit behind or... they've got another deadline just before ours and they want to get that one out of the way first. So there will be good reasons why it's at the last minute...

3.2. Quality of tender documents

Interview with the contractor. The views on the quality of tender documents are different, as Table 3 shows. The contractor revealed that the quality of tender documents is sometimes poor. The contractor insisted that the quality of a document varies depending on who prepared it. A lack of time and budget limitations for producing tender documents were pointed out as some of the factors that affect the quality of tender documents. Unsurprisingly, it was strongly stated that poor tender documents have a considerable impact on tender prices (Laryea, 2011; Hosny et al., 2019). In particular, quotations from subcontractors are not likely to be consistent when the information provided by the client is not clear.

...It has a significant impact on bidding prices. Poor quality documents make it harder for me to get subcontractors to tender the price. The job is broken down into 20 or 30 packages. For each of them, there is a bit of information that they are looking for that isn't there, they've got all their questions coming back, which is a lot of information to process. All

Table 3. Different views on the quality of tender documents

	Client	Consultant	Contractor
Quality of tender documents	Declined; Poorly coordinated; Not integrated; Errors and duplication		Consistent; There has always been significant variance (both good and bad tender documents)
Factors that affect the quality of tender documents	Inappropriate resources (Trainees conducting important tasks)	Low professional fees, short timescales and lack of proper resources (graduates checking critical parts of tendering)	Low professional fees and short timescales to produce documents

those questions we have to pass on and ask again. There are many questions. If you are asking people to price your documents, and it's not there, it's not complete and it's not sufficient...instead of getting a price range of 5% to 10%, you may get a price range of high as 50% to 80% variance between the lowest price and the highest price...

The wide variation in the offers of the tenderer is likely to bring uncertainty, as it will be difficult to determine which tender is priced accurately. However, the contractor does not consider the poor quality of tender documents as a risk during the tendering process. Instead, the contractor focuses on contractual risks related to contract period, payment, and liquidated damages (Zhang et al., 2016; Schuhmann & Eichhorn, 2017; Benítez-Ávila et al., 2018). In terms of the declining quality of tender documents, the contractor believed that the quality has been consistent over time.

...I'm personally not sure if they are declining. Overall, it's difficult to say that there is a pattern of decline there. What you're probably seeing is maybe a tighter budget for consultants and pressure on people to get things cheaper and quicker. I would say that the quality has been consistent. So, I've seen bad tender docs and good tenders as well. I still see both. I would say, on average, it's consistent...

Interview with the consultant. The consultants admitted that they often had to send out incomplete tender documents because of insufficient time set by the client and other consultants, such as designers and engineers, who did not meet their own deadlines (Lopez & Love, 2012; Khalifa & Mahamid, 2019). The consultant shared the view held by the contractor that the quality of tender documents significantly affects the bidding price.

... So there needs to be a fully completed design. I suppose it depends on the contract; for a design and build contract, there needs to be a full, clear idea of what they want to build. For a standard building contract, a fully designed building that works is coordinated. And often it isn't complete. Quantity surveyors often leave it too late to do tender documents, and the information is incomplete. The instructions are not clear, and the form of tender is not clear. And what happens is you get loads of queries back from the contractor and it just automatically gives them an idea that the client who they are going to be working for isn't organized and competent. So if you get a complete set of documents, and it is really good quality, you send them out. The contractor sees that they are going to be really keen to work for that client, you are going to get a really good price back. If the design is poorly defined, they will price a lot of risk into it. Thus, you will get higher prices back or they won't price parts of it, or they'll price the wrong parts of it. So you will just get prices all over the place that you can't compare. And you will get prices that are hard to interpret...

Owing to the poor quality of tender documents, tenderers end up taking on high risks, as they are uncertain about the design aspects of the project. Consequently, this will increase the overall tender price, which means it may be difficult for the client to expect to receive a competitive tender. Therefore, coordination between the client and other consultants is important to produce good quality information so that contractors can price the project appropriately. However, unlike the contractor, the consultant stated that the quality of tender documents is deteriorating because of insufficient project timescales, low professional fees, and slower decision making by local authorities who seem burdened with increasing bureaucratic procedures.

...So it's always going to decline...The client reduces the timescale and fees so you've got too much stuff to do at once. So what happens is that the work is pushed down to the lower levels, to the graduates on their systems, and work isn't checked properly, and then the work is of lower quality. I think it's tightening time scales and fees...

Interview with the client. The client is not satisfied with the quality of tender documents, which are poorly worded, and contain many errors and duplications. The client believes that this phenomenon may be related to professional fee levels. Unlike the consultant, the client argued that professional fees have not been cut and reflect the work involved in providing professional services.

... I think quality has declined... they are not coordinated and integrated properly. Whether that's a client's problem, in which case we haven't built a team properly, or whether it's just an individual discipline's problem... I do find documents aren't well-coordinated. I don't think it's related to the timeframes for producing the document, and I think it might be related to the fee. The fees on specialist historical building works for an architect are still between 10 and 12%, which is quite high, they haven't cut their fees ... Certainly, the percentage fee hasn't come down at all... I don't think the structures in lots of organizations are as in-depth. So you are not getting the progression through the office of training and learning. Therefore, there are not enough school leavers or recent graduates. The cheap labor, like trainees, are placed to pick up some of the checking and doing...

4. Discussion

The regulatory system for tendering practices has improved significantly. Bid rigging is a type of illegal cartel activity. As well as bid rigging, business cartels can also involve other illegal practices such as sharing commercially sensitive information, fixing process (keeping them artificially high) and dividing up markets with competitors. Bid rigging is illegal and there can be significant financial and personal consequences for breaking the law. The number of tenderers and their details can be obtained from the enterprises in the supply chain, even when this information is not furnished by the consultant. According to the consultant, information on the number of tenderers can sometimes be shared with contractors if there are only a few, to keep the contractor's interest. However, this number will not be revealed if there are more than six tenderers competing for a single project, as the contractors will not be motivated to bid. The contractor would not consider bidding on a project when there were more than five competitors. This result agrees with Bagies and Fortune (2006), who found contractors scrutinize the market competition and react accordingly. This finding also corroborates Laryea and Hughes (2008), who suggested that the likelihood of winning a tender is low, at around one in six. The argument put forward by the contractor indicates that contractors plan their bidding strategies in accordance with the project information from consultants. Contractors are provided with only selective information from consultant, which mean there could be intentionally exposing information that is favorable to the client or/and consultant and concealing information that is unfavorable to the contractor. It may be another significant risk for contractors to make bid/no-bid decisions with distorted project information.

Contractors always access the limited information and to analyze all latent risky factors within short period of bidding stage, contractors carefully assess their approaches when making bid or no-bid decisions (Jarkas et al., 2014; Olawale & Sun, 2015; Chisala, 2017). In the UK, contractors can make contact with consultants relatively easily during biding stage. Based on experts' interview, this study found that contractors rely heavily on consultant's information and try to strengthen the relationship with client than analysis the tendering documents during bidding stage, which are unexpected and somewhat conflicting finding with previous studies that have found that contractors complain of short tender periods, and it is challenging to accurately interpret and analyze all tender documents within the limited timescale set by the client (Alavipour & Arditi, 2018).

This study found that contractors balance their workload within the full tender period. Resources are managed across a number of different bids at the same time and prioritize their workload regardless of the timescale set by the client. The finding was corroborated by the consultant, who stated that contractors generally wait to look at the tender documents after they are issued. Thus, it cannot be argued that contractors are initially given a short timescale.

One finding is that the contractors in the sample did not confirm that the quality of tender documents has declined. The senior project and commercial managers from the UK contractor insisted that the quality of tender documents has been consistent. This contradicts the findings in the literature (Xiang et al., 2015; Mohammed et al., 2019) which suggest that the quality of information provided by the client has been deteriorating in terms of clarity and completeness. It was recognized that the client and consultant admitted that the quality of tender documents is poor, as this admission highlighted a lack of professionalism in the industry. Like Laryea and Lubbock (2013) and Love et al. (2017) argument, poor tender documents influence construction costs and, in particular, hinder contractors from obtaining accurate quotations from the supply chain. Therefore, from the finding of this study, the reason why contractors aware that there has been no decline in the quality of tender documents can be interpreted that how much they have relied on the supply chain's information rather than on accuracy and analysis of tender documents. The tender document which is recognized significantly to the client and consultant is not actually regarded as such important to contractors who will analyze and utilize it as the basis for bid/no-bid decisions.

Conclusions

This study provides a balanced view on tendering practices and the quality of tender documents by gathering the perspectives of the principal stakeholders in the construction sector: the client, the consultant, and the contractor within the supply chain. The findings reveal that there are similarities and differences in the perspectives on tendering practices held by the 10 interviewees. The contractor perceives that the quality of tender documents has been consistent, albeit not commenting the tender documents are sufficient, whereas the client and the consultant share the view that the quality of documents has declined. Low professional fees, short timescales, and lack of coordination at the design stage are considered the main factors affecting the clarity and completeness of tender documents. However, behind it, the information obtained from the supply chain seems to have a greater impact on the bid/ no-bid decisions than the quality of the tender documents. The consultant responds to a significant number of tender queries, which are normally caused by poorly worded tender documents. By contrast, the contractor issues tender queries to build a good relationship with the client in the early tender stage regardless of the clarity of the tender documents. The client acknowledges this phenomenon; therefore, it is suggested that the workload of the contractor and availability of unofficial information are important factors affecting the quality of bids.

Bidding is a practice in which each project stakeholders try to minimize risk based on limited and incomplete tendering information (Adafin et al., 2016; Asgari et al., 2016; Bohari et al., 2021). Therefore, bidding strategy of each stakeholder is commercially sensitive, making it difficult to conduct honest and in-depth study. In addition, it is not a common opportunity to study different stakeholder's tendering perspectives on a common project. It is beneficial to examine the points of view of other project stakeholders, including those of clients and consultants, to obtain more reliable data regarding the quality of tender documents.

This study gathered different perspectives on the quality of tender documents and bid/no-bid decisions during the tendering process. Furthermore, it examined specific tendering strategies of client, contractor, and consultant in current tendering practices and proposed efficient ways of improving the bidding environment. With the understanding of other's tendency and behavior, each stakeholder can improve their practical strategy in tendering practice. Research findings and analysis are based on UK construction industry where contractor can obtain unofficial data and information from supply chain during bidding stage. Thus, unlike literature reviews of this study, the most critical factor for tendering practice may not be the quality of tender documents, but other factors in the UK, such as the establishment of a special relationship between contractor and client or consultant during. The findings of this study may have been different if the samples had been collected from other sectors and geographical locations. Future studies can gather the viewpoints of other entities in the supply chain to produce more practical tendering practices and approaches that could effectively be implemented in the UK construction industry. In addition, it can be studied further that whether the viewpoints of client, contractor, and consult are differentiated in other construction industries where different procurement system is shaped according to its own legislation.

References

- Adafin, J., Rotimi, J. O. B., & Wilkinson, S. (2016). Determining significant risks in the variability between design stage elemental cost plan and the final tender sum. *Journal of Management in Engineering*, 32(6), 05016016. https://doi.org/10.1061/(ASCE)ME.1943-5479.0000448
- Ahmed, M. O., El-adaway, I. H., Coatney, K. T., & Eid, M. S. (2016). Construction bidding and the winner's curse: Game theory approach. *Journal of Construction Engineering and Management*, 142(2), 04015076. https://doi.org/10.1061/(ASCE)CO.1943-7862.0001058
- Alavipour, S. M., & Arditi, D. (2018). Impact of contractor's optimized financing cost on project bid price. *International Journal of Project Management*, 36(5), 808–818. https://doi.org/10.1016/j.ijproman.2018.03.001
- Alptekin, O., & Alptekin, N. (2017). Analysis of criteria influencing contractor selection using TOPSIS method. *IOP Conference Series: Materials Science and Engineering*, 245, 062003. https://doi.org/10.1088/1757-899X/245/6/062003
- Al-Reshaid, K., & Kartam, N. (2005). Design-build pre-qualification and tendering approach for public projects. *International Journal of Project Management*, 23(4), 309–320. https://doi.org/10.1016/j.ijproman.2004.11.004
- Arabiat, A., Edum-Fotwe, F. T., & McCaffer, R. (2007). Does client behaviour actively induce risk in construction projects? In *Proceedings of the 23rd Annual ARCOM Conference* (pp. 745–754), Association of Researchers in Construction Management, Belfast, NI.
- Asenahabi, B. M., Busula, A. O., & Ronoh, R. (2019). A choice dilemma in the selection of an appropriate research design. *International Journal of Advanced Research in Computer En*gineering & Technology (IJARCET), 8(8), 348–356.
- Asgari, S., Kandil, A., & Odeh, I. (2016). Optimal risk attitude for construction contractors in competitive bidding environments. In *Construction Research Congress* (pp. 2474–2480). https://doi.org/10.1061/9780784479827.246

- Bagies, A., & Fortune, C. (2006). Bid/ no-bid decision modelling for construction projects. In *Proceedings of the 22nd Annual ARCOM Conference* (pp. 511–521), Birmingham, UK. Association of Researchers in Construction Management.
- Benítez-Ávila, C., Hartmann, A., Dewulf, G., & Henseler, J. (2018). Interplay of relational and contractual governance in public-private partnerships: The mediating role of relational norms, trust and partners' contribution. *International Journal* of Project Management, 36(3), 429–443. https://doi.org/10.1016/j.ijproman.2017.12.005
- Bochenek, J. (2014). The contractor selection criteria in open and restricted procedures in public sector in selected EU countries. *Procedia Engineering*, *85*, 69–74. https://doi.org/10.1016/j.proeng.2014.10.530
- Bohari, A. A. M., Ikau, R. A., Budin, H., Hadi, N. A., & Chan, V. S. L. (2021). The key criteria in deciding to tender for construction projects. *International Journal of Integrated Engineering*, 13(3), 229–235. https://doi.org/10.30880/ijie.2021.13.03.028
- Chairul, M., Umanailo, B., & Hamid, I. (2019). Utilization of qualitative methods in research universities. In *Proceedings of the International Conference on Industrial Engineering and Operations Management* (pp. 2076–2081). IEOM Society International.
- Chan, D. W. M., Chan, A. P. C., Lam, P. T. I., & Wong, J. M. W. (2011). An empirical survey of the motives and benefits of adopting guaranteed maximum price and target cost contracts in construction. *International Journal of Project Management*, 29(5), 577–590.
 - https://doi.org/10.1016/j.ijproman.2010.04.002
- Cheaitou, A., Larbi, R., & Al Housani, B. (2019). Decision making framework for tender evaluation and contractor selection in public organizations with risk considerations. *Socio-Economic Planning Sciences*, 68, 100620. https://doi.org/10.1016/j.seps.2018.02.007
- Chisala, M. L. (2017). Quantitative bid or no-bid decision-support model for contractors. *Journal of Construction Engineering and Management*, 143, 4017088. https://doi.org/10.1061/(ASCE)CO.1943-7862.0001407
- De Schepper, S., Haezendonck, E., & Dooms, M. (2015). Understanding pre-contractual transaction costs for Public–Private Partnership infrastructure projects. *International Journal of Project Management*, 33(4), 932–946.

https://doi.org/10.1016/j.ijproman.2014.10.015

- Elhag, T. M. S., Boussabaine, A. H. & Ballal, T. M. A. (2005). Critical determinants of construction tendering costs: Quantity surveyors' standpoint. *International Journal of Project Management*, 23(7), 538–545. https://doi.org/10.1016/j.ijproman.2005.04.002
- Hassim, S., Muniandy, R., Alias, A. H., & Abdullah, P. (2018). Construction tender price estimation standardization (TPES) in Malaysia. *Engineering, Construction and Architectural Management*, 25(3), 443–457. https://doi.org/10.1108/ECAM-09-2016-0215
- Heravi, A., Coffey, V., & Trigunarsyah, B. (2015). Evaluating the level of stakeholder involvement during the project planning processes of building projects. *International Journal of Project Management*, 33(5), 985–997. https://doi.org/10.1016/j.ijproman.2014.12.007
- Hastie, J., Sutrisna, M., & Egbu, C. (2017). Modelling knowledge integration process in early contractor involvement procurement at tender stage – a Western Australian case study. *Construction Innovation*, 17(4), 429–456. https://doi.org/10.1108/CI-04-2016-0021

- Hosny, H. E., Ibrahim, A. H., & Elmalt, A. E. (2019). Factors affecting quality of tender documents. *Al-Azhar University Civil Engineering Research Magazine (CERM)*, 41(1), 346–355.
- Jarkas, A. (2013). Primary factors influencing bid mark-up size decisions of general contractors in Kuwait. *Journal of Financial Management of Property and Construction*, 18(1), 53–75. https://doi.org/10.1108/13664381311305078
- Jarkas, A., Mubarak, S. A., & Kadri, C. Y. (2014). Critical factors determining bid/no bid decisions of contractors in Qatar. *Journal of Engineering Management*, 30(4), 05014007. https://doi.org/10.1061/(ASCE)ME.1943-5479.0000223
- Khalifa, W. M. A., & Mahamid, I. (2019). Causes of change orders in construction projects. *Engineering, Technology & Applied Science Research*, 9(6), 4956–4961. https://doi.org/10.48084/etasr.3168
- Krishna Rao, M. V., Kumar, V. S. S., & Kumar, P. R. (2018). Optimal contractor selection in construction industry: The fuzzy way. *Journal of The Institution of Engineers*, 99, 67–78. https://doi.org/10.1007/s40030-018-0271-1
- Laryea, S. (2011). Quality of tender documents: case studies from the UK. Construction Management and Economics, 29(3), 275–286. https://doi.org/10.1080/01446193.2010.540019
- Laryea, S., & Hughes, W. (2008). How contractors price risk in bids: theory and practice. *Construction Management and Economics*, 26(9), 911–924.

https://doi.org/10.1080/01446190802317718

- Laryea, S., & Hughes, W. (2011). Risk and price in the bidding process of contractors. *Journal of Construction Engineering* and Management, 137(4), 248–258. https://doi.org/10.1061/(ASCE)CO.1943-7862.0000293
- Laryea, S., & Lubbock, A. (2013). Tender pricing environment of subcontractors in the United Kingdom. *Journal of Construction Engineering and Management*, 140(1), 04013029. https://doi.org/10.1061/(ASCE)CO.1943-7862.0000749
- Liu, T., Wang, Y., & Wilkinson, S. (2016). Identifying critical factors affecting the effectiveness and efficiency of tendering processes in Public–Private Partnerships (PPPs): A comparative analysis of Australia and China. *International Journal of Project Management*, 34(4), 701–716. https://doi.org/10.1016/j.ijproman.2016.01.004
- Lopez, R., & Love, P. E. D. (2012). Design errors in construction projects. Journal of Construction Engineering and Management, 138(5), 585–593.

https://doi.org/10.1061/(ASCE)CO.1943-7862.0000454

- Love, P. E. D., Zhou, J., Matthews, J., Sing M. C. P., & Edwards, D. J. (2017). System information modelling in practice: Analysis of tender documentation quality in a mining mega-project. *Automation in Construction*, 84, 176–183. https://doi.org/10.1016/j.autcon.2017.08.034
- Love, P. E. D., Ika, L. A., Ahiaga-Dagbui, D. D., Locatelli, G., & Sing, M. C. (2019). Make-or-break during production: shedding light on change-orders, rework and contractors margin in construction. *Production Planning & Control*, 30(4), 285– 298. https://doi.org/10.1080/09537287.2018.1535675
- Low, W. W., Abdul-Rahman, H., & Zakaria, N. (2015). The impact of organizational culture on international bidding decisions: Malaysia context. *International Journal of Project Man*agement, 33, 917–931.

https://doi.org/10.1016/j.ijproman.2014.10.010

Mbachu, J., & Cross, C. (2015). Key drivers of discrepancies between initial and final costs of construction projects in New Zealand. *PM World Journal*, 4(9), 1–13.

- Mohammed, H. H., Ibrahim, A. H., & El-Malt, A. E. (2019). Assessment of tender documents quality index. *American Journal of Civil Engineering and Architecture*, 7(4), 172–180.
- Olawale, Y., & Sun, M. (2015). Construction project control in the UK: Current practice, existing problems and recommendations for future improvement. *International Journal of Project Management*, 33(3), 623–637. https://doi.org/10.1016/j.ijproman.2014.10.003
- Oltmann, S. (2016). Qualitative interviews: A methodological discussion of the interviewer and respondent contexts. *Forum Qualitative Sozialforschung / Forum: Qualitative Sozial Research*, 17(2). https://doi.org/10.17169/fqs-17.2.2551
- Oyeyipo, O. O., Odusami, K. T., Ojelabi, R. A., & Afolabi, J. A. (2016). Factors affecting contractors' bidding decisions for construction projects in Nigeria. *Journal of Construction in Developing Countries*, 21(2), 21–35. https://doi.org/10.21315/jcdc2016.21.2.2
- Puri, D. & Tiwari, S. (2014). Evaluating the criteria for contractors' selection and bid evaluation. *International Journal of Engineering Science Invention*, 3(7), 44–48.
- Queirós, A., Faria, D., & Almeida, F. (2017). Strengths and limitations of qualitative and quantitative research methods. *European Journal of Education Studies*, 3(9), 369–386.
- Reza Alavipour, S. M., & Arditi, D. (2018). Impact of contractor's optimized financing cost on project bid price. *International Journal of Project Management*, 36(5), 808–818. https://doi.org/10.1016/j.ijproman.2018.03.001
- Saaidin, S., Endut, I. R., Samah, S. A. A., & Ridzuan, A. R. M. (2017). Stakeholder's perspective on risks allocation in design and build projects in Malaysia. In *MATEC Web of Conferences* (Vol. 103). EDP Sciences.

https://doi.org/10.1051/matecconf/201710303009

- Schuhmann, R., & Eichhorn, B. (2017). Reconsidering contract risk and contractual risk management. *International Journal* of Law and Management, 59(4), 504–521. https://doi.org/10.1108/IJLMA-02-2016-0023
- Simon, L., Jefferies, M., Davis, P., & Newaz, M. T. (2020). Developing a theoretical success factor framework for the tendering phase of social infrastructure PPPs. *International Journal* of Construction Management, 20, 613–627. https://doi.org/10.1080/15623599.2020.1720343
- Tan, Y., Shen, L., & Langston, C. (2010) Contractors' competition strategies in bidding: Hong Kong study. *Journal of Construction Engineering and Management*, 136(10), 1069–1077. https://doi.org/10.1061/(ASCE)CO.1943-7862.0000219
- Tarhini, A., Ammar, H., Tarhini, T., & Masa'deh, R. (2015). Analysis of the critical success factors for enterprise resource planning implementation from stakeholders' perspective: A systematic review. *International Business Research*, 8(4), 25–40. https://doi.org/10.5539/ibr.v8n4p25
- Urquhart, S., & Whyte, A. (2018). Contractor tendering research: going beyond bid/no-bid and markup models. *Management*, *Procurement and Law*, 170(6), 255–262. https://doi.org/10.1680/jmapl.17.00039
- Urquhart, S., Whyte, A., & Lloyd, N. (2017). The development of a more efficient internal tender procedure of framework for Australian construction contractors. In *Proceedings of the* 33rd Annual ARCOM Conference (pp. 693–702). Cambridge.
- Watt, D. J., Kayis, B., & Willey, K. (2010). The relative importance of tender evaluation and contractor selection criteria. *International Journal of Civil Engineering*, 28(1), 51–60. https://doi.org/10.1016/j.ijproman.2009.04.003

- Wibowo, M. A., Astana, I. N. Y., & Rusdi, H. A. (2015). An analysis of bidding strategy, project performance and company performance relationship in construction. *Procedia Engineer*ing, 125, 95–102. https://doi.org/10.1016/j.proeng.2015.11.015
- Xia, B., Chen, Q., Xu, Y., Li, M., & Jin, X. (2018). Design-build contractor selection for public sustainable buildings. *Journal* of Management in Engineering, 31(5), 040140701-7. https://doi.org/10.1061/(ASCE)ME.1943-5479.0000295
- Xiang, P., Hou, X., & Shen, L. (2015). Research on the phenomenon of asymmetric information in construction projects – the case China. *International Journal of Project Management*, 33(3), 589–598.

https://doi.org/10.1016/j.ijproman.2014.10.007

- Yuan, J., Skibniewski, M. J., Li, Q., & Zheng, L. (2010). Performance objectives selection model in public-private partnership projects based on the perspective of stakeholders. *Journal* of Management in Engineering, 26, 89–104. https://doi.org/10.1061/(ASCE)ME.1943-5479.0000011
- Yuni, N., Norken, I. N., Sudarsana, D. K., & Adnyana, I. (2017). Risk analysis of tender documents on the execution of private construction work at Badung Regency, Bali Province, Indonesia. *Journal of Sustainable Development*, 10(4), 130–142. https://doi.org/10.5539/jsd.v10n4p130
- Zhang, S., Zhang, S., Gao, Y., & Ding, X., (2016). Contractual governance: effects of risk allocation on contractors' cooperative behavior in construction projects. *Journal of Construction Engineering and Management*, 142(6), 04016005. https://doi.org/10.1061/(ASCE)CO.1943-7862.0001111
- Zhang, N., Deng, X., Zhao, X., & Chang, T. (2018). Exploring the sources of contractors' competitive advantage on international HSR construction projects. *International Journal of Civil Engineering*, 17(7), 1115–1129.

https://doi.org/10.1007/s40999-018-0373-1

Zhou, T., Xuedong, G., & Guiying, W. (2021). Construction method of tender document based on case-based reasoning. International Journal of Computers, Communications and Control, 16(3). https://doi.org/10.15837/ijccc.2021.3.4170